
Boldface    Heading or defined term. 
Underlining    Added to existing law by original bill. 
Single strikethrough   Deleted from existing law by original bill. 
Double underlining   Added by Amendment. 
Double strikethrough   Deleted from existing law or the bill by amendment. 
* * *     Existing law unaffected by bill. 
 

ORDINANCE NO.  O-19-10 
 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL TO 
REPEAL AND RE-ENACT WITH AMENDMENTS CHAPTER 5 OF THE 

GAITHERSBURG CITY CODE ENTITLED, “BUILDINGS,” ARTICLES I, II, III, IV 
AND V, SECTIONS 5-1 THROUGH 5-11, AND ADOPT BY REFERENCE, WITH 

CERTAIN MODIFICATIONS, THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE  
AS ARTICLE I THEROF, THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE  

AS ARTICLE II, THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE  
AS ARTICLE III, THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION 

CODE AS ARTICLE IV, AND THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS 
CODE AS ARTICLE V 

 
 
 BE IT ORDAINED by the Mayor and City Council of Gaithersburg, in public 
meeting assembled, that Chapter 5 of the City Code entitled “Buildings”, is hereby 
repealed and re-enacted with amendments to read as follows: 
 
 

CHAPTER 5 
 

BUILDINGS 
 

Article 1.  The International Building Code (2003) (2009) 
 
Sec. 5-1. Building Code—Adoption of the International Building Code (2003) 
(2009), in the ICC  2003 2009 Series Codes.  
 The International Building Code (2003) (2009), unless specified otherwise in this 
article, as published by The International Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted as 
the building code of the City, except as modified by Section 5-3.  
 
Sec. 5-2. Scope. 
 
 This chapter shall apply to the construction, alteration, addition, repair, removal, 
demolition, use, location, occupancy, and/or maintenance of all buildings and 
structures, and their service equipment, within the City of Gaithersburg, except 
detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple attached single family dwellings 
(townhouses) not more than 3 stories in height with separate means of egress, and 
their accessory structures. It supersedes Ordinance No. 0-14-02 0-2-06, dated 
November 13, 2002 February 6, 2006, and all previous regulations adopting the 
International Code Council (ICC) standards for building code. Its purpose is to adopt 
the 2003 2009 editions of the International Building Code, the International 



 2 

Residential Code, the International Mechanical Code, the International Energy 
Conservation Code, and the International Fuel Gas Code, with modifications 
necessary to achieve uniformity and consistency with certain Maryland, Montgomery 
County, and City of Gaithersburg laws and ordinances, as well as certain Planning 
and Code Department policies and procedures. Where this ordinance differs from 
any other City of Gaithersburg ordinances, it does not preempt or negate any more 
restrictive provisions adopted by those ordinances.  
 
Sec. 5-3. Same—Modifications to the International Building Code 2003 2009.  
 
 The International Building Code (2003) (2009) is modified as follows:  
 (1) General. Whenever the words "name of jurisdiction" appear in this code, insert 

the words "the City of Gaithersburg".  
 

(2) General. Whenever the words "building official" appear in this code, they shall 
be deemed to mean the city manager or his her designee.  

 
(3) General. Whenever the words "department" or "department of building safety" 

appear in this code, they shall be deemed to mean the City of Gaithersburg, 
Department of Planning and Code Administration, Permits and Inspections 
Division.  

 
(4) General. Delete all references to "the ICC Electrical Code" in this (IBC) or any 

other International Code adopted by this ordinance, and replace with "the City 
of Gaithersburg Code, Chapter 7, Electricity."  

 
(5) Subsection 101.2. To # 1 Exception, add the following:  

"townhouses may include a loft, and must also comply with Chapter 12 
(Interior Environment) and Chapter 16, subsection 1612.3 (City floodplain 
regulations) of this  code (the International Building Code, hereafter referred 
to as the IBC) as amended."  
Add Exception (# 2) to read as follows:  Existing buildings, as defined by the 
Maryland Building Rehabilitation Code, undergoing repair, alterations or 
additions and change of occupancy shall be permitted to comply with the 
Maryland Building Rehabilitation Code. 

 
(6) Subsection 101.2.2. Add new subsection 101.2.2 to read as follows:  

"All construction projects financed, in part or in full, by the City of 
Gaithersburg, shall  conform to all pertinent provisions of this code and all 
other codes adopted by the City of Gaithersburg to regulated safety in the built 
environment. This includes obtaining all  permits and inspections that would be 
required of any private sector work. No fees will be charged for City sponsored 
construction."  

 
 
 



 3 

(7) Subsection 101.3.1. Add new subsection 101.3.1 to read as follows:  
"Purpose: The purpose of issuing permits, reviewing and approving plans, and 
conducting inspections is to protect and promote public safety, health, and 
welfare. These activities are purely governmental in nature, are conducted 
solely for the public benefit, and are not to be construed as providing any 
warranty by the City, as to design or construction, to anyone. Nothing in this 
ordinance should be construed as creating any legal duty to the owner, 
operator, or user of any premises."  

 
(8) Subsection 101.4.1.  Delete the phrase “ICC Electrical Code” and replace with 

“The City of Gaithersburg Electrical Code, Chapter 7”. 
 

(98) Subsection 101.4.2 101.4.1.  Delete the phrase “International Fuel Gas Code” 
in the first sentence and insert the phrase “Regulations Governing the 
Installation of Plumbing, Gasfitting and Sewer Cleaning in the Washington 
Suburban Sanitary District,” as published by The Washington Sanitary 
Commission (WSSC). Add a new sentence at the end of the subsection to 
read, “The Provisions of the International Fuel Gas Code shall apply only in 
instances that are not governed by WSSD regulations.” 

 
(109)Subsection 101.4.4. 101.4.3 Delete the phrase “International Plumbing Code” 

in the first sentence and insert the phrase “Plumbing and Gasfitting 
Regulations of the Washington Suburban Sanitary District.” In the last 
sentence, delete the phrase “International Private Sewage Disposal Code” and 
replace with the phrase, “the Montgomery County Department of Health.” 

 
(1110)Subsection 101.4.5 101.4.4.  After the phrase “International Property 

Maintenance Code” add the following phrase: “as adopted by the City of 
Gaithersburg, City Code, Chapter 17AA.” 

 
(1211)Subsection 101.4.6 101.4.5. Delete the phrase: 

  “International Fire Code” and replace it with the following phrase “The City of 
  Gaithersburg Fire Code, Chapter 11, City Code”. 
 

(12) Subsection 101.4.7 Add new subsection 101.4.7, Electricity, to read as 
follows: Any and all references in this code to electricity or the code governing 
electricity shall mean “The City of Gaithersburg Electrical Code, Chapter 7”. 
 

(13)  Subsection 102.1. At the end of subsection 102.1, add the following:  
 "Exception: Alternative features which are accepted or approved in writing by 

the Building Official shall be considered as conforming with all codes, provided 
that the overall level of health, safety, and welfare is not diminished."  

 
 
 
 



 4 

(14) Subsection 102.6. Delete the phrase:  
"the International Property Maintenance Code or the International Fire Code," 
and replace it with "or any other applicable provision of the City of 
Gaithersburg Code."  

 
(15) Section 103.  Delete. 

 
(16) Subsection 105.2. Delete the following provisions of the subsection:  

2, 4, 6, 7 – partial, cabinets and countertops that don't interfere with egress, 9, 
12, and 13 – partial, for items that don't interfere with egress. Also delete in 
their entirety the portions of this subsection regarding gasfitting and plumbing. 

 
(17) Subsection 108.2 109.2 Edit as follows:  

Delete the words "gas" and "plumbing systems;” delete the phrase "the 
applicable  governing authority" and replace it with "the Mayor and City 
Council."  

 
(18) Subsection 108.3 109.3 Delete.  

 
 

(19) Subsection 109.3.10. 110.3.10 Add the following:  
"The final inspection must be requested and approved before a building (or 
portion thereof) is used or occupied in any way, including moving in any 
furniture, shelving stock, equipment, files, and similar items unless specific, 
written permission is obtained from the building official. (E.G. OK to stock.)"  

 
(20) Subsection 110.1 111.1. After the phrase "No building or structure", add the 

phrase: "or portion thereof."  
 

(21) Subsection 110.2. 111.2 Delete all text in this subsection after the phrase 
"shall issue a certificate of occupancy" and replace it with the following phrase 
"as per department policy." 

 
(22) Section 112 113. Delete subsections 113.1, 113.2 and 113.3 and add new 

subsection 113.1 as follows:  
"Section 112. 113.1  Board of Appeals. Any decision or order of the City 
Manager or his designee under this chapter may be appealed within 30 days 
of the date of such decision or order to the City Board of Appeals.  Any 
decision of the City Board of Appeals may be appealed to the Circuit Court 
within 30 days of the date of the Board's written decision. Such appeals shall 
be governed by the Maryland Rules of Procedure. Any decision of the Circuit 
Court may be appealed to the appellate courts of this state."  

 
 
 



 5 

(23) Subsection 113.4 .114.4 Delete the phrase "subject to penalties as described 
by law," and   replace with:  
"guilty of a municipal infraction, enforceable and punishable by a fine and/or 
penalty as  established by the Mayor and City Council pursuant to Sections 
1-9 through 1-11 of the City Code. Each day that a violation exists shall be 
deemed a separate offense."  
"In addition thereto, the City may institute injunctive, mandamus, or any other 
appropriate action or proceedings at law or equity for enforcement of this 
Chapter, or to correct violations of this Chapter, and any court of competent 
jurisdiction shall have the authority to issue restraining orders, temporary or 
permanent injunctions or mandamus or other appropriate form of remedy or 
relief."  

 
(24) Subsection 114.3 115.3 Delete the phrase "subject to penalties as prescribed 

by law," and  replace with:  
"liable to a fine or civil penalty as established by the Mayor and City Council, 
pursuant to Section 1-10 of the City Code."  
"In addition thereto, the City may institute injunctive, mandamus, or any other 
appropriate action or proceedings at law or equity for enforcement of this 
Chapter, or to correct violations of this Chapter, and any court of competent 
jurisdiction shall have the authority to issue restraining orders, temporary or 
permanent injunctions or mandamus or other appropriate form of remedy or 
relief." 

 
 

(25)Section 116. Demolition of Structures. Add new section 116 to read as follows: 
 "Section 116. Demolition of Structures.”  
 

Subsection 116.1. Service Connections. Before a structure is demolished or 
removed, the owner or agent shall obtain, from all utilities having service 
connections to that structure, official written verification of disconnection of 
service to said structure. A permit to demolish or remove a structure shall not 
be issued until the Building Official has received all such notices."  

 
"Subsection 116.2. Notice to Adjoining Owners. Only when written notice has 
been given by the applicant to the owners of adjoining lots and to the owners 
of wired or other facilities, of which the temporary removal is necessitated by 
the proposed work, shall a  permit be granted for the removal of a building or 
structure."  

 
"Subsection 116.3. Lot Restoration and Maintenance. Whenever a structure is 
demolished or removed, the premises shall be maintained free from unsafe or 
hazardous conditions by the proper restoration, servicing and maintenance of 
the lot, restoration of established grades and the erection of necessary 
retaining walls, fences, etc. as needed, in accordance with the provisions of 
Chapter 33 of this Code (IBC)."  



 6 

 
(2625)Section 202. Definitions. Add the following definition after the word “Loads”:  

"Loft. A loft is a habitable area between the uppermost story and the roof of a 
townhouse or an R-2 occupancy. The loft shall not be more than 40 percent of 
the floor below, and shall be open to the floor below. A loft shall not count as a 
story of height."  

 
(2726)Subsection 305.2. Change "2½" to "2." 
 
(2827)Section 308.2. In the last paragraph, change the word "five" to "eight,” and 

the word "six" to "nine."  
 

(2928)Subsection 308.3.1. Change "2½" to "2."  
 

(29) Subsection 308.5.2 In code text and exception, change 2 ½ to 2. 
 

(30) Subsection 310.1. After the description for R-3 occupancies, add the following:  
 "Exceptions:  

  1. A family day care home, which is a dwelling in which child day care 
services are provided: a) in the home where the registrant is the 
provider and a resident, or where the registrant is not a resident, but 
more than half of the children cared for are residents; b) for not more 
than eight children, including the children of the provider, who are less 
than six years of age, and; c) where staffing complies with state and 
local regulations, but no more than two non-resident staff members are 
on site at any time, may be classified as Group R-3, or as a one- or 
two-family dwelling conforming to the IRC."  

 
 2. A group day care home, which is a dwelling in which child day care 
services are provided: a) in the home where the licensee is the provider 
and a resident; b) for nine to 12 children, including the children of the 
provider, and; c) where staffing complies with state and local regulations, 
but no more than three non-resident staff members are on site at any 
time, may be classified as Group R-3, or as a one- or two-family dwelling 
conforming to the IRC."  

 
(31) Section 403.2.1.2 Delete. 

 
(32) Section 403.4.4 Delete the phrase “Section 510 of the International Fire Code” 

and Replace with “the Montgomery County Fire Safety  Code”. 
 

(33) Section 419.  Delete. 
 

(34) Chapter 4.  Add new section 424 Residential Occupancies. 
 
 424.1  All R occupancies shall have appropriate radon control features 

prescribed in Appendix F in the International Residential Code, 2009 edition. 



 7 

 
(3135)Subsection 501.2. Premises Identification. Delete the text and replace with 

the following: 
"All buildings in the City shall display their address numbers in accordance 
with the regulations set forth in the Fire Code, Chapter 11, City of 
Gaithersburg Code."  

 

(36) Section 509.2  Add condition #8 as follows: 
8.  For purposes of determining the number of stories above grade, a story 
above the 3-hour horizontal assembly shall be considered a story above grade 
regardless of the location of the average grade plane.   

 
(37) Section 703.6 Amend item 3 to add a sentence as follows:  “The sign or 

stenciling shall identify the fire resistance rating in hours.” 
 

(38) Section 716.5.3 In the first sentence of Exception 2, replace “In  Group B and 
R” with“In buildings, other than Group H”. 

 
(3239)Subsection 903.1.1. Alternative Protection. Delete the text and replace with 

the following: 
Section 903.1.1 Delete and replace with the following:  903.1.1  Alternative 
Protection. 
Where water as an extinguishing agent is not compatible with the fire hazard, 
or is prohibited by a law, statute, or ordinance, the affected area must be 
protected by an approved automatic fire-extinguishing system utilizing an 
extinguishing agent that is  compatible with the fire hazard. 

 
 

(33) Subsection 903.2.2. In the first sentence, delete the phrase "20,000 square 
feet" and replace with "2,000 square feet. 
 

(40) Subsection 903.2.3 In the first sentence, delete the phrase “12,000 square 
feet” and replace with “2,000 square feet”. 

 
(3441) Subsection 905.3.  Preface the text with the following statement, “In new 

installations where the code requires either Class II or Class III standpipes, 
Class I standpipes must be installed.  Occupant use hose is prohibited in 
either new or existing buildings.” 

 
(3442)Subsection 907.3.3 907.4.2.3  Delete. 

 
(35) Subsection 909.16.  After the words “fire command center complying with 

Section 911”  add “or location approved by the City of Gaithersburg Fire 
Marshal.”  
 



 8 

(43) Subsection 915.1 Delete the phrase “Section 510 of the International Fire 
Code” and replace with “the Montgomery County Fire Safety Code”.   

 
(44) Add new subsection 1003.5.1 to read as follows:  Elevation changes of 21 

inches or less in a means of egress shall be achieved in accordance with the 
City of Gaithersburg Fire Code.   

 
(45) Subsection 1007.3.  Delete Exception 1,2,3 & 7. 

 
(46) Subsection 1007.4 Delete Exception 2.   

 
(47) Subsection 1008.1.2.  Add a sentence at the end to read:  “Doors in exit 

enclosures shall swing in the direction of egress travel unless the door 
opening serves an individual living unit that opens directly into an exit 
enclosure.” 

 
(48) Subsection 1008.1.9.10.  In Exception #3, delete all text after the phrase 

“…openable from the egress side”. 
 

(49) Subsection 1009.13.  At end of the section add the phrase “or ladder 
complying with Section 7.2.9 of the Life Safety Code, 2009 edition”. 

 
(50) Subsection 1012.6.  At the end of the last sentence add the phrase “unless, in 

the opinion of the AHJ, an extension in the same direction of the stair or ramp 
creates a hazard in the means of egress.”   

 
(51) Subsection 1012.7.  Change “1 ½” to “2 ¼”.   

 
(52) Subsection 1013.1. After the phrase “equipment platforms,” add the phrase 

“retaining walls,” 
 

(53) Subsection 1013.2.  In exception #1 and #2, change “34 inches (864 mm)” to 
“36 inches (915 mm)”.  Add a fifth exception:  Exception 5.  In occupancies in 
Group R-3, and within individual dwelling units in occupancies in Group R-2, 
interior guards shall be at least 36 inches high.   

 
(54) Subsection 1013.3.  Delete Exception #6. 

 
 (37) Subsection 1009.3. In exception #5, change "7.75 inches" to "8.25 inches", 

and change"10 inches" to "9 inches" in both instances. 
 
 (38) Subsection 1012.1. After the first occurrence of the phrase "floor or grade 

below" insert  the phrase "and retaining walls with a difference in grade level 
on either side of the wall exceeding 30 inches and within 2 feet of a walk, path, 
parking lot, or driveway on the  high side."  

 
 
 



 9 

  (39) Subsection 1013.2.  Add new exception #3 to read as follows:  
"Egress shall be permitted to pass through a storeroom of Group M 
occupancy, provided the following requirements are met:  

  (1) The building is fully sprinklered, per this code.  
(2) The egress path through the storeroom is defined by permanent, 

fixed-in-place guardrail(s), or low wall(s), at least 42" high, and 
with at least one intermediate rail. Openings for passage shall 
not exceed 36" in width.  

(3) The egress path shall have permanent signage stating the 
following message:  "Exit Path — Do Not Block, By Order of the 
City Fire Marshal, $500.00 Fine."  

 

(55) Section 1015.2.1.  Add the following exception: Exception 3.  In buildings of 
Group R-2 four stories or less in height above the grade plane that are served 
by two required exterior stairways connected by an open-ended corridors in 
compliance with Exception 4 of Section 1026.6 (Exception 4) shall be provided 
with remoteness between the near edge of the required landings that are 
separated by a distance of at least one third the length of the maximum overall 
diagonal dimension of the area served. 

 

 
(4056)Subsection 1016.1. Exception #4. Delete existing text and replace with the 

following: 
"A fire resistance rating is shall not be required by this code for corridors within 
single- tenant Group B occupancies."  

 
(57) Section 1020. Add a new section 1020.3 to read as follows: 

 
Section 1020.3.  Fire Department Access to Floors.  Not less than one exit 
stair which serves all stories of the building shall be accessible by an internal 
corridor from the main entrance of the building or the fire department response 
location. 

 
(4158)Chapter 11.  Delete the chapter and replace with "The Maryland Accessibility 

Code." 
 

(4259) Add new Subsection 1210.6 "Visual Mold" to read as follows: 
"All structures constructed under the provisions of this code shall be free from 
any signs of visual mold. Construction materials that exhibit visual signs of 
mold shall be removed and replaced.  
Exception: At the discretion of the Building Official, non-porous materials may 
be treated to remove mold as directed by an approved environmental engineer 
accepted by  the City of Gaithersburg."  



 10 

 
(4360) Section 1511. Add new section 1511 to read as follows: 

“Section 1511 Rooftop Screening. All mechanical and/or HVAC equipment 
located on the roof of a building, including, but not limited to, elevator shafts, 
water tanks, coolingtowers, heating and air conditioning units of any type, 
exhaust air and make-up air units,shall be effectively screened from view from 
all sides. Such screening shall be at least to the height of such equipment, and 
shall be constructed of materials that are compatible with the exterior 
construction of the building. The elevation plans for the screening must  be 
submitted to and approved by planning staff of the Planning and Code 
Administration department. The construction plans for the screening must 
demonstrate conformance with all applicable provisions of this code (IBC) and 
the City Mechanical Code (IMC), and must meet any requirements for space, 
ventilation, or other requirements dictated by the equipment manufacturer. Site 
lines will be taken into account by City staff before approval of the screening is 
determined in determining approval of screening proposals.” 

 
(44) Subsection 1607.11.3.  Add new subsection 1607.11.3 to read as follows: 

“Section 1607.11.3 Roof Drainage. Roof drainage shall be designed and 
constructed in accordance with all applicable provisions of Chapter 11 of the 
International Plumbing Code (2003). This amendment shall not supersede any 
requirements of the WSSC Plumbing Regulations. 

 

(61) Table 1607.1 Item 29 Roofs.  Modify the uniform live load value for “Ordinary 
flat, pitched and curved roofs” to 30 pounds per square foot, nonreducible. 

 
(62) Subsection 1607.11.5.  Add new subsection 1607.11.3 to read as follows: 
 “Section 1607.11.5 Roof Drainage. Roof drainage shall be designed and 

constructed in accordance with all applicable provisions of Chapter 11 of the 
International Plumbing Code (2009). This amendment shall not supersede any 
requirements of the WSSC Plumbing Regulations.  

 
(63)  Add a new section as follows: 

 
Section 1607.14.  Fire Truck Loading.  Structural members subject to 
fire truck loading shall be designed for the concentrated loads applied 
by the vehicle to the structure as described below: 

 
The maximum fire truck operating weight is 85,000 pounds distributed 
in three axles spaced 19 feet 6 inches and 4 feet 6 inches apart.  The 
transverse wheel distance is 8 feet 2 inches.  The front axle weighs 
23,000 pounds and rear axles weigh 31,000 pounds each.  When the 
ladder is up, the vehicle is raised and supported on four (4) outriggers 
spaced 10 feet apart along the length of the vehicle and 16 feet apart in 
the transverse direction.  Depending upon the position of the ladder, 



 11 

any pair of two front, side or rear outriggers apply to the structure a 
force of 123,552 pounds (61,776 pounds per outrigger in accordance 
with NFPA 1901, Chapter 20.21.4.2) and the remaining two outriggers 
apply a force of zero (0) pounds.  Outrigger pad dimensions are 2 feet 2 
inches wide by 2 feet 6 inches long. 

 
 (4564)Subsection 1608.2, referencing Table 1602. Ground Snow Loads. The 

ground snow load for the City of Gaithersburg shall be 30 psf. 
 

(4665)Subsection 1612.3. Where the subsection calls for name of jurisdiction, insert 
"the City of Gaithersburg, as contained in Chapter 10 of the City Code." Where 
the subsection calls for date of issuance, insert "April 27, 1992."  

 
(66) Section 1704.4.  Delete Exception 1. 

 
(67) Section 1704.4. Amend exception 2.1 by adding the word “or” after the 

semicolon.  Amend exception 2.2 by deleting the word “or” after the semicolon.  
Delete Exception 2.3 

 
(68) Table 1704.4 Items 10 and 11.  Modify the inspection frequency from 

“periodic” to “continuous”. 
 

(69) Table 1704.4 Item 11.  Add the sentence to the first column, “The strength 
evaluation shall be demonstrated by field cured cylinders only.” 

 
(47) Subsection 1805.2.1. After the phrase "frost line of the locality" insert "at least 

30 inches below the adjacent finished grade." 
 

(70) Subsection 1809.5.  After the phrase "frost line of the locality", insert "at least 
30 inches below the adjacent finished grade." 

 
(71) Add a new subsection as follows:   

 
1901.2.1. For precast structures, in the case of a conflict between ACI 318 and 
PCI Design Handbook, the requirements of ACI 318 shall control the design. 

 
 

(4872)Chapter 29. Delete chapter in its entirety and replace with the following: 
“Plumbing and Gasfitting Regulations in the City of Gaithersburg are under the 
jurisdiction of the Washington Suburban Sanitary Commission” and 
“Exception: Roof drainage requirements not addressed by the WSSC 
Plumbing and Gasfitting Regulations shall conform to all applicable sections of 
the International Plumbing Code/2003, Chapter 11.” 

 
 
 
 



 12 

(4973)Subsections 3001.2, 3001.3, and 3001.4. Delete and replace with the 
following:  
"Subsection 3001.2. Standards. The Maryland Department of Labor, 
Licensing, and Regulations, Division of Labor and Industry, regulates the 
design, installation, inspection, and testing of all hoisting and conveying 
equipment."  

 
(5074)Subsection 3107.1. (Signs) General. Delete the text and replace with the 

following: 
"All signs, and substantial modifications to existing signs, shall conform to the 
requirements of the City Zoning Ordinance and all applicable provisions of this 
code (IBC/2003). Where conflict exists between this code and the City Zoning 
Ordinance, the Zoning Ordinance shall take precedence."  

 
(5175)Subsection 3107.2. Sale and Rental Signs. Add new subsection 3107.2 to 

read as follows: 
"Subsection 3107.2 Sale and Rental Signs. Unless otherwise provided in the 
City Sign Ordinance (Chapter 24, Article IX) a permit shall not be required for 
signs to announce the sale or rental of property, provided that such signs are 
not more than four (4) square feet in area."  

 
 (5276)Subsection 3107.3.  Sign Height. Add new subsection to read as follows:  

"Subsection 3107.3. Sign Height. The lowest point of any sign which extends 
over an area intended for unrestricted vehicular traffic shall be a minimum of 
14 feet above the highest traffic surface."  

 
(5377)Subsection 3109.1.  General. Add the following sentence to the end of the 

subsection:  
"Public swimming pools are also required to conform to requirements of the 
Montgomery  County Department of Health."  

 
 (5478)Subsection 3109.3. Public Swimming Pools. In the first sentence, change "4 

feet" to "5 feet". To the end of the second sentence, add the following:  
"latches shall be placed at least 4 feet above the ground and the fence shall 
not have a pattern or design that creates a ladder effect."  

 
 (5579)Subsection 3109.4.1. Barrier Height and Clearances (Residential). In the first 

sentence, change "48 inches" to "60 inches."  
 

(5680) Subsection 3109.4.1.1.  Openings. Add the following to the end of the 
sentence:  

 "and the fence shall not have a pattern or design that creates a ladder effect."  
 

 



 13 

(57) Subsection 3109.6.  Electrical Requirements. Add new subsection to read as 
follows: 

 "Subsection 3109.6.1. Electrical Requirements.  
 1. "All electrical installations provided for, installed and used in conjunction 

with private residential pools, shall be in conformance with the Electrical 
Code, Chapter 7, City of Gaithersburg Code.” 

 2.  No current-carrying electrical conductors shall cross private residential 
swimming pools, either overhead or underground, or within 15 feet of 
such pools, except wiring for associated pool equipment, such as lights, 
pool pump motors, etc.  

 3. All metal fences or railings near or adjacent to pools, which might 
become electrically active as a result with broken overhead conductors or 
from any other cause, shall be effectively grounded." 

 
 (5881)Subsection 3109.6.2. Annual Inspection Requirements. Add new subsection 

to read as follows:  
"Subsection 3109.6.2. Annual Inspection Requirements. All public and 
community swimming pools shall be inspected on a yearly basis to determine 
compliance with applicable City codes and ordinances. NOTE: Private 
certification by an electrician licensed in the City is permitted."  

 
(82) Add new Section 3111, Green Building Requirements. 

  
3111.1 Scope.  All buildings, and the accompanying building sites, listed in this 
section shall be constructed in accordance with the green building standards 
that are referenced herein. 

 
3111.2 Commercial and High Rise Residential Buildings 

 
3111.2.1 Scope.  For the purpose of this subsection, these requirements shall 
pertain to newly constructed or “substantially improved”* commercial and high 
rise residential buildings equal to or larger than 10,000 square feet.  
Substantially improved structures include renovations or reconstruction of 
existing buildings with at least 10,000 square feet of gross floor area that alter 
more than 50% of the GFA and additions that double the building’s footprint or 
add at least 10,000 square feet of GFA, and/or as defined below: 

 
* Substantial improvement, as defined by the International Existing Building 
Code, is any repair, alteration, addition, or improvement of a building or 
structure, the cost of which equals or exceeds 50 percent of the market value 
of the structure, before the improvement or repair is started. 
 
3110.2.2 Requirements.  Applicable structures equal to or larger than 10,000 
square feet, but no larger than 50,000 square feet, must achieve a certification 
from the U.S. Green Building Council’s (USGBC) Leadership in Energy and 



 14 

Environmental Design (LEED®) green building rating system of a Certified-
level rating or higher in LEED NC 2.2 or LEED CS 2.0 OR comply with energy 
and environmental design standards that the City Manager may adopt by 
regulation, pursuant to Section 2-10 of the City Code, as equivalent to a 
Certified-level rating in the appropriate LEED rating system.  Applicable 
structures equal to or larger than 50,000 square feet must achieve a 
certification from the USGBC LEED green building rating system of a Silver-
level rating or higher in LEED NC 2.2 or LEED CS 2.0 OR comply with energy 
and environmental design standards that the City Manager may adopt by 
regulation, pursuant to Section 2-10 of the City Code, as equivalent to a Silver-
level rating in the appropriate LEED rating system.    

 
3111.2.3 Submittals. Prior to the issuance of grading permits, the applicant 
shall submit documentation showing the project has been registered with the 
USGBC and the applicable LEED registration fee has been paid OR meets the 
standards that the City Manager may adopt by regulation as equivalent to the 
appropriate LEED rating system. The applicant shall also submit a checklist 
that is prepared, signed, and dated by the project LEED accredited 
professional OR a checklist that is approved by the City Manager that 
demonstrates the applicant meets with the equivalent standards.   

 

3111.2.4 Verification. No later than eighteen (18) months after the receipt of a 
Certificate of Use and Occupancy, the applicant shall provide proof to that the 
required LEED-level rating was obtained. 
 
3111.2.5 Waiver. A waiver or modification of the green building requirements 
may be granted by the Planning Commission, upon recommendation by the 
City Manager or his/her designee, based upon a finding that unique physical 
characteristics of the property or the project make strict compliance with 
Section 3111 impracticable; however, financial hardship of meeting LEED 
shall not be the sole basis for approving a waiver or modification.  

 
3111.3 Multifamily Residential Structures 

 
3111.3.1 Scope.  For the purpose of this subsection, the scope shall include 
multifamily buildings and sites designed as Use R-2 and R-3 buildings that are 
type V construction and 4 stories or less in height, and do not fall under the 
purview of the International Residential Code as single family dwellings.  This 
shall include the multifamily portion of any mixed or multi-use building.  These 
requirements shall pertain to new construction of, reconstruction of, additions 
to, or substantial improvement* (as defined in the International Existing 
Building Code) of multi-family buildings as described above. 

 
* Substantial improvement, as defined by the International Existing Building 
Code, is any repair, alteration, addition, or improvement of a building or 
structure, the cost of which equals or exceeds 50 percent of the market value 
of the structure, before the improvement or repair is started. 



 15 

 
3111.3.2 Requirements. 

  
1).  Energy Performance:  Improve overall energy performance by designing 
and building high performing ENERGY STAR qualified homes by meeting or 
exceeding the following requirements1

  
:  

 Requirements ‘a-g’ meet those included in the ENERGY STAR Qualified 
Homes National Builder Option Package (BPO) (as of September 19, 2007).  
Requirements ‘h-i’ exceed the BPO program and are included in LEED Homes 
and Green Communities criteria. 
 

(a) Cooling equipment:  13 SEER A/C; OR ENERGY STAR qualified 
heat pump (11.5 EER/ 8.5 HSPF), or be in compliance with the 
International Energy Conservation Code/2009. 

(b) Heating equipment: ENERGY STAR qualified gas furnace (90 
AFUE); OR ENERGY STAR qualified heat pump; OR ENERGY 
STAR qualified boiler (85 AFUE); OR 85 AFUE oil furnace.  Homes 
with heat pumps in Climate Zone 4 must have an HSPF > 8.5, which 
exceeds the ENERGY STAR minimum of 8.2 HSPF, or be in 
compliance with the International Energy Conservation Code/2009. 

(c) Water heaters:     
Gas (EF): 40 Gal = 0.61  60 Gal = 0.57  80 Gal = 0.53 
Electric (EF): 40 Gal = 0.93  50 Gal = 0.92  80 Gal = 0.89 
Oil or Gas: Integrated with space heating boiler, 
or be in compliance with the International Energy Conservation 
Code/2009. 

 
(d) Appliances: Install ENERGY STAR qualified clothes washers, 

dishwashers, and refrigerators. 
(e) Lighting:  Reduce electric load due to lighting by selecting and 

installing the following measures, or be in compliance with the 
International Energy Conservation Code/2009:    
(i) Efficient exterior lighting- All exterior lighting shall have automatic 

photocell, motion, or timer controls.  Outdoor lighting shall have a 
horizontal cutoff to eliminate light trespass from the building and 
site and to minimize impact on nocturnal environments. Use 
downlighting instead of uplighting. 

(ii) Efficient interior lighting- Install at least four ENERGY STAR-
labeled lighting fixtures or ENERGY STAR Advanced Lighting 
Package in all interior units.  Install compact fluorescent lamps 
(CFLs) or equivalent in at least 80% of applicable light fixtures. 

 
 

                                                           
 
 



 16 

(2) Healthy Living Environment:  Protect occupants from exposure to 
contaminants by meeting or exceeding the following ventilation, source 
control, and source removal measures2

 
:  

a) Heating, Ventilation, and Air Conditioning (HVAC) sizing:  Size 
heating and cooling equipment in accordance with the Air 
Conditioning Contractors of America Manual, Parts J and S, to 
prevent short-cycling of heating or air conditioning and ensure 
adequate dehumidification.  (The HVAC unit may be upsized at the 
discretion of the building code official.) Compliance with the 2009 
International Energy Conservation Code is also acceptable.    

b) Garage isolation:  Provide a continuous air barrier between the 
conditioned (living) space and any unconditioned garage space to 
prevent the migration of any contaminants into the living space. In 
single-family houses with attached garages, install a CO alarm 
inside the house on the wall that is attached to the garage or is 
outside the sleeping area.   

c) Water heaters- mold prevention:  Use tankless hot water heaters or 
install conventional hot water heaters in rooms with drains or catch 
pans piped to the exterior of the dwelling and with non-water 
sensitive floor covering. 

d) Water heaters- minimizing CO:  Specify direct vented or combustion 
sealed water heaters if the heater is located in a conditioned space.  

e) Cold water pipe insulation: Insulate exposed cold water pipes in 
climates and building conditions susceptible to moisture 
condensation.   

f) Building Materials:  Building materials shall meet or exceed the 
following requirements: 
(i) Structural plywood conforming to PS1 and PS2 and oriented 

strand board shall be made with exterior-type adhesives.  
Exterior-type adhesive is evident by the appearance of 
“Exposure 1” or “Exterior” in the panel trademark. 

(ii) Particleboard and medium density fiberboard (MDF) shall be 
certified compliant with the low formaldehyde emission standards 
ANSI A208.1 and A208.2, respectively. 

(iii) Hardwood plywood shall be compliant with ANSI/HPV HP-1-
2004 and U.S. HUD Title 24, Part 3280. 

(iv) Carpets, carpet pad, and carpet adhesives shall carry the Carpet 
and Rug Institute (CRI) Green Label or documented to meet the 
CRI Green Label testing program criteria for low-emitting 
products.  Products labeled with the CRI Green Label Plus also 
meet this requirement. 

(v) Permeability rating of finishes used on the interior side of a 
home’s exterior walls in hot humid and humid mixed climates 
shall be greater than ‘1’. 

                                                           
2 Requirements ‘a-e’ are derived from the Enterprise Foundation’s Green Communities 
Criteria and requirement ‘f’ is derived from ENERGY STAR with Indoor Air Package 
Specifications (as of September 19, 2007). 



 17 

 
(3) Waste Management:  Divert construction, demolition, and land clearing 

materials from landfill disposal and reduce the demand for virgin resources 
by developing a Construction, Demolition, and Land clearing (CDL) Waste 
Management Plan with a goal to divert a minimum of 50% (by weight) of 
CDL waste from the landfill by one, or a combination of the following 
activities: salvage, reuse, source-separated CDL recycling, or co-mingled 
recycling.  

(i) The plan should include such CDL materials, but not limited to: 
acoustical ceiling tiles, appliances, asphalt, asphalt shingles, 
brick, cabinets, cardboard packaging, carpet and carpet pad, 
concrete, doors, drywall, fixtures, fluorescent lights and ballasts, 
garage doors, glass (window), glass (other), green waste and 
land clearing debris, gypsum board, metals, paint, plastic, wood, 
field office waste (office paper, aluminum cans, glass, plastic, 
and office cardboard), and other salvage materials.  The plan 
must be submitted as part of the permit application and will 
address the materials used or deconstructed on site, 
management method, hauler, destination, approximate 
quantities, and handling procedures.   

(ii) The plan shall be posted at the job site and implementation shall 
include:  
1. Waste prevention and recycling activities will be discussed at 

each safety meeting 
2. As each new subcontractor comes on-site, the recycling 

coordinator will present him/her with a copy of the Waste 
Management Plan and provide a tour of the recycling areas. 

3. The subcontractor will be expected to make sure all their 
crews comply with the Waste Management Plan. 

4. All recycling containers will be clearly labeled. 
5. Lists of acceptable/unacceptable materials will be posted 

throughout the site.  
 

(4) Homeowner Education:   Educate the homeowner about the home’s green 
features and the operation and maintenance of key features and equipment 
related to optimizing home performance by completing the following: 

 
(a) Owner’s Manual:  Provide a homeowner manual, to be included 

in the submittal of building plans, that includes the following:  
i) A guide for homeowners and renters that explains the 

intent, benefits, use and maintenance of green building 
features, and encourages additional green activities such 
as recycling, landscaping, and use of healthy cleaning 
materials;  

ii) Instructions and a routine maintenance plans for all 
appliances, HVAC operation, water-system turnoffs, 
lighting equipment and other systems that are part of each 
occupancy unit; and  



 18 

iii) An occupancy turnover plan that describes in detail the 
process of educating the tenant about proper use and 
maintenance of all building systems.   

(b) Homeowner and New Resident Orientation:  Provide a walk-
through and orientation to the homeowner or new resident that 
reviews the building’s green features, operations, and 
maintenance.  

 
(5) Sustainable Sites 

 
1. Four Story Multifamily Residential 

 
a. Priority LEED NC credits that directly address some of the critical 

environmental issues facing this region and the bay3

i. Site selection (SSC1);  
: 

ii. Transportation- parking capacity (SC4.4); 
iii. Stormwater design quantity control (SS6.1);  
iv. Stormwater design quality controls (SS6.2).   
v. Non-roof heat islands (SS7.1);  
vi. Roof heat islands (SS7.2);  
vii. Water efficient landscaping- reduce by 50% (WEC1.1); 
viii. Water use reduction – 20% (WEC3.1); 
ix. Construction IAQ Management Plan – During Construction (EQ3.1) 
x. Construction IAQ Management Plan – Before Occupancy (EQ3.2) 

 
3111.3.3 Waiver. A waiver or modification of the green building requirements 
may be granted by the Planning Commission, upon recommendation by the 
City Manager or his designee, based upon a finding that unique physical 
characteristics of the property or the project make strict compliance with 
Section 3110 impracticable; however, financial hardship shall not be the sole 
basis for approving a waiver or modification. 
 

 
(5983)Subsection 3302.3. Construction in Occupied Buildings. Add new subsection 

to read as follows:  
“Subsection 3302.3. Construction in Occupied Buildings. Existing occupied 
buildings and/or spaces shall not remain occupied during construction 
operations.  
Exception: Where the building or space is adaptable to a phasing operation 
that clearly demonstrates to the building official that the health, safety, and 
welfare of the occupants of that building is not jeopardized in any way by the 
construction project, and that the provisions set forth in subsection 3302.3.1 
can be met."  

 

                                                           
3 See attached for a summary of the credit requirements. 
 



 19 

(6084)Subsection 3302.3.1. Safety Requirements. Add new subsection to read as 
follows:  
"Subsection 3302.3.1. Safety Requirements. All buildings/spaces approved by 
the building official for construction to occur while the buildings/spaces are 
occupied shall conform to the following requirements:  

 1. Construction areas shall be completely separated from occupied areas by a 
solid, noncombustible barrier.  

• In non-sprinklered buildings, this barrier shall have a minimum fire 
rating of one hour, and shall extend from the floor to the underside of 
the next deck above, roof or floor.  
•  In fully sprinklered buildings, an alternative barrier of a solid, limited 
combustible wall, at least 6 feet in height, with a limited combustible, 
non-solid dust barrier (such as fire retardant plastic sheeting) extending 
to the ceiling above is acceptable.  
• In both cases, openings for workers to access construction areas shall 
be through self-closing gates, constructed of material similar or equal to 
the walls, and posted with signage notifying occupants they are not 
permitted to enter the construction area.  

2. All required exits, egress paths, etc., that serve the occupied area(s) shall 
remain open, free from obstruction or construction related hazards, at the full 
required width, and in complete conformance with all applicable City of 
Gaithersburg codes regarding egress from buildings.  

  
 3. All fire suppression and fire protection systems shall be kept in working order 

in accordance with the City Fire Code.  
 4. All HVAC and mechanical systems shall be completely isolated at construction 

areas to prevent the spread of dust, fumes, noxious odors, etc., from 
spreading into occupied areas.  

 5. Violations of this section will result in one or more of the following actions being 
   taken:  
 • A Stop Work order being placed on the job.  

• A municipal infraction of $200.00  $500.00 (minimum) being levied for 
each day the violation exists (amount is dependent upon type of 
violation.)  
• A Cease and Desist Occupancy order being placed on the occupied 
establishment that is endangered by the violation."  

 
   (85) Section 3303 Demolition.  Add new subsection 3303.1, delete subsection 

3303.6, and renumber the remaining subsections from 3303.2 through 3303.6. 
Subsection 3303.1.  General.  All demolitions of structures, partial or full, shall 
conform to all applicable City of Gaithersburg codes, policies and procedures. 

   



 20 

 
(6186)Subsection 3401.2. Add the following at the end of the first sentence: 

“Existing buildings, as defined by the Maryland Building Rehabilitation Code, 
undergoing repair, alterations, additions, and/or change of occupancy, shall be 
permitted to comply with the Maryland Building Rehabilitation Code.”  
Compliance with this subsection shall not preclude compliance with the City of 
Gaithersburg Fire Code. 

 
 (6287)Appendix F. Appendix F is hereby adopted in its entirety.  
 
 

(6388)Appendix G. Appendix G is hereby adopted in its entirety and amended as 
follows: 
"Appendix G. Section G102.1. After the words "International Building Code" 
insert the phrase "and the provisions of Chapter 10 of the City of Gaithersburg 
Code."  

 
Section G102.2 Replace the parentheses and the phrase within the 
parentheses with the effective date of this regulation. 

 
(6489)Appendix H.  Appendix H is adopted in its entirety except for any instances 

where   there is a conflict with the City of Gaithersburg Sign Ordinance (City 
Code, Chapter 24, Article IX) or amendments (49), (50), and (51) or any sign-
related amendments of this document, any of which shall take precedence 
over this appendix. 

 
 (6590)Appendix I. Appendix I is hereby adopted in its entirety. 
 

(6691)Appendix F of the 2003 2009 International Residential Code.  Appendix F of 
the International Residential Code is hereby adopted in its entirety and shall 
apply to all residential Use and Occupancy classifications. 

 

ARTICLE II.  THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE (2003) (2009) 

Sec. 5-4.  Building Code—Adoption of the International Residential Code (2003) 
(2009) 
 The International Residential Code (2003) (2009), unless specified otherwise, as 
published by The International Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted as the building 
code for one- and two-family dwellings and townhouses in the City, except as 
modified by Section 5-5. 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 21 

Sec. 5-5.  Same—Modifications. 
 The International Residential Code (2003) (2009), adopted by Section 5-4, is 
hereby modified  as follows: 

(1) Whenever the words “name of jurisdiction or jurisdiction” appear in this code, 
insert the words “the City of Gaithersburg.” 

 (2) Whenever the words “building official” appear in this code, they shall be 
deemed to mean the city manager or his her designee. 

 (3) Whenever the words “department” or “department of building safety ” appear 
in this  code, they shall be deemed to mean the City of Gaithersburg, 
Department of Planning and Code Administration, Permits and Inspection 
Department. 

 (4) Delete all references to “the ICC Electrical Code” in this (IBC) or any other 
International  Code adopted by this ordinance, and replace with “the City of 
Gaithersburg Code, Chapter 7, Electric Code.” 

 (5) Section 101.2 Scope.  Delete Exception. 
 (56) Section R103 Delete. 

(67) Subsection R105.2 Delete items #1, 2, 3, and 5 and 10 from the “Building” list. 
Delete electrical and gas. 

 (78) Subsection R105.3.1.1 Delete. 
(89) Subsection R108.2 Delete the word “gas and plumbing”; delete the words 

“applicable governing authority” and replace with “the mayor and city council.” 
 (910) Subsection R109.1 At the end of the sentence paragraph, add the following: 

“and all other inspections listed in the City of Gaithersburg inspection guide 
and/or required by department policy.” 

 (1011)Subsection R109.1.2 Delete the word words "plumbing and gas". 
(1112)Subsection R109.1.3 Floodplain inspections.  In addition to the requirements 

of this subsection, all requirements of the City of Gaithersburg Floodplain 
Regulations (City Code, Chapter 10) shall apply. 

(1213)Subsection R109.2 After the word accept, insert the following phrase, “as 
required by department policy”. 

 (14) Subsection R109.12 Delete words plumbing and gas. 
(1315)Subsection R110.3 Delete the phrase “the department of building safety”, 

and replace with “the City of Gaithersburg”; place a period after the phrase 
“certificate of occupancy”, and delete the rest of the subsection. 

 

 (1416)Section R112.  Delete and replace with the following: 
“Section R112.  Board of Appeals. Any decision or order of the City manager 
or his  designee under this chapter may be appealed within 30 days of the 
date of such decision or order to the City Board of Appeals. Any decision of 
the City Board of Appeals may be  appealed to the Circuit Court within 



 22 

30 days of the date of the Board’s written decision. Such appeals shall be 
governed by the Maryland Rules of Procedure. Any decision of the  Circuit 
Court may be appealed to the appellate courts of this state.” 

 
(1517)Subsection R113.4 Delete the phrase “subject to penalties as described by 

law”, and replace with “guilty of a municipal infraction, enforceable and 
punishable by a fine and/or penalty as established by the Mayor and City 
Council pursuant to Sections 1-9 through 1-11 of the City Code, and that each 
day that a violation exists shall be deemed a separate offense.” 
“In addition thereto, the City may institute injunctive, mandamus, or any other 
appropriate action or proceedings at law or equity for enforcement of this 
Chapter, or to correct violations of this Chapter, and any court of competent 
jurisdiction shall have the  right to issue restraining orders, temporary or 
permanent injunctions or mandamus or other appropriate form of remedy or 
relief.” 

 
(1618)Subsection R114.2 Delete the phrase “subject to penalties as described by 

law”, and replace with “liable to a fine or civil penalty as established by the 
Mayor and City Council, pursuant to Section 1-10 of the City “In addition 
thereto, the City may institute injunctive, mandamus, or any other
 appropriate action or proceedings at law or equity for enforcement of 
this Chapter, or to correct violations of this Chapter, and any court of 
competent jurisdiction shall have the right to issue restraining orders, 
temporary or permanent injunctions or mandamus or other appropriate form of 
remedy or relief.”  

  
(1719)Add new Section 115 Add new section "Unsafe Structures and Equipment" 

as it appears in Section 115 116 of the IBC (2003) (2009).   

(1820)Climatic and geographic design criteria to be inserted in Table No. R301.2(1) 
as follows: 

 “Ground snow load   30 psf 
 Wind speed    90 mph 
 Topographic Effects   No  
 Seismic Design Category  B 
 Weathering    Severe 
 Frost Depth     30 inches 
 Termite     Moderate to Heavy 
 Decay      Slight to Moderate 
 Winter Design Temperature   13(f) 
 Ice Shield Underlayment Required  Yes 
 Flood Hazard     Chapter 10, City Code (4/27/92) 
 Air Freezing Index    300 
 Mean Annual Temperature   55(f)” 
 

(1921)Subsection R301.2.4 At the end of the first paragraph add the following: “and 
in accordance with City of Gaithersburg Code Chapter 10.” 

            



 23 

(2022)Table No. 301.5 Minimum Uniformly Distributed Live Loads.  Change Decks 
from 40 psf to 60 psf Live Load. 

 
Add new Section R306.5 “Pressure Sewer Systems Involving the Use of 
Grinder Pumps”   to read as follows: The use of a pressure sewer system 
involving the installation and use  of a grinder pump is prohibited unless the 
following requirements are met. 

   (1) Prior to the issuance of a building permit, the applicant shall submit to the 
City the sum of Seven Thousand Five Hundred Dollars ($7,500) per 
dwelling unit to be placed in an escrow account to be devoted to future 
maintenance and repairs of grinder pumps and appurtenance facilities. 

 (2) The City shall relinquish such payment upon written request to any 
lawfully formed condominium association or home owner’s association 
responsible for the common maintenance of property within which the 
dwelling units are located; provided that such condominium home 
owner’s association covenants with the City to escrow such funds in a 
separate account and use such funds only for the repair and 
maintenance of the grinder pumps and appurtenance associated with 
properties within the boundaries of their association. 

 (3) Should there be no condominium or homeowner’s association involved 
with the dwelling units constructed, the City shall reimburse a property 
owner whose property is secured by escrowed funds for maintenance 
and repairs of the property owners grinder pump and appurtenance not to 
exceed Seven Thousand Five Hundred Dollars ($7,500) upon written 
verified request of said property owners." 

(23) Subsection R302.1 Exterior Walls.  Exception 4, Change “2 feet” to “3 feet”. 
(24) Table R302.1  Delete Row “25%  maximum of wall area, 0 hours and 3 feet” 

under “Openings in walls” section. 
(25) Subsection R302.2 Townhouses, Exception.  Change “1-hour fire resistant 

rated wall” to “2-hour fire resistant rated wall. 
 
 (2126)Section R309.1  R302.5.1 Add new paragraph to the end to read as follows: 

“Doors shall be equipped with a mechanical closure or spring hinges, and be 
adjusted so that the doors are self-closing and latching. The sills of all door 
openings between the garage and dwelling shall be raised not less than four 
(4) inches above the garage floor.” 

 
(22) Add new Section R310.4.1 “ Window Sill Heights” to read as follows: 

“In rooms where window sill heights are less than 24 inches above the interior 
finished floor and greater than 36 inches above grade on the exterior, screens 
shall be installed and securely attached to the window frame to prevent 
unintentional dislodging of either the screen fabric or the perimeter frame. All 
window and screen components shall conform to Section R310 of this code.” 

 
 



 24 

(2327)Subsection R311.1 Add new sentence to the end of paragraph to read as 
follows: 
“Egress from any habitable level of a townhouse including lofts, to the exit 
door shall not require vertical travel of more than two stories” 

 
 (24) Subsection R311.5.3.1  The first sentence is amended to read as follows: 
  “The maximum riser height shall be 8-1/4 inches (210 mm). 
 
 (25) Subsection R311.5.3.2 Change “10 inches (254mm)” to “9 inches (229mm)” in 

both occurrences.  
  
 (28) Subsection R311.7.7 Change “four” to “three”. 
 
 (2729)Subsection R312.1 After the word “balconies” add “retaining walls”   

 
 (30) Subsection R312.2.2 After the word “balconies” add “retaining walls”. 
 (31) Subsection R313.2 Remove “effective January 2011 an”. 
 (32) Subsection R313.2.1 Remove “section P2904 or” 
 (33) Subsection R314.3.1 Exception 1, remove “or the addition of a porch or deck”. 
 
 (28) Subsection R321.1 "Site Address ". Delete text and replace with the following: 

“All dwellings shall be provided with minimum 5 inch high address numbers, 
contrasting in color and visible from the street in which the dwelling is 
addressed. Buildings under  construction shall have the address number 
and street name displayed at all times.” 

 
 (29) Add new Section R324 “Automatic Sprinkler Systems” to read as follows: “An 

automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with applicable NFiPA 
standards as adopted by Chapter 11 of the City Code is required for all new 
detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings.”  

   
 (34) Subsection R319 Site Address.  Remove “or alphabetical letters”.  Change 4 

to 5 and 102 mm to 127 mm. 
 
 (35) Add new Section R324 “Sound Transmission” to read as follows: 

Sound transmission between dwelling units shall be regulated as set forth in 
Section 1207 of the 2009 International Building Code. 

  
(3036)Add new Section R325 “Visual Mold” to read as follows: “All structures 

constructed under the provisions of this code shall be free from any signs of 
visual mold. Construction materials that exhibit visual signs of mold shall be 
removed and replaced. 
Exception: At the discretion of the Building Official non-porous materials may 
be treated to remove mold as directed by an approved environmental engineer 
accepted by the City of Gaithersburg.” 



 25 

 
(3137)Subsection R405.1 Add a new sentence to the end of the first sentence to 

read as follows: 
  “Perimeter drains shall also be installed under all concrete slabs.” 
 

(3238)Subsection R406.1 Add a new sentence to the end of the first paragraph to 
read as follows: 
“All wall ties used in concrete foundation walls shall be coated with approved 
heavy  bituminous material.” 

 
 (33) Subsection R408.2 Delete the first exception.  
 

(3439)Subsection R807.1 After the second sentence of the second paragraph add 
the following sentence to read as follows: 
“Attic access openings shall not be installed in closets with a depth and width 
of less five (5) feet and shall not be above a vertical line extending from the 
outside edge of any shelving.” 

 
(3640)Appendix F. Appendix F is hereby adopted in its entirety. 

 
Delete sections R.502.2.2.1 to R.502.2.2.3 
Replace with “Decks shall be constructed in accordance with City policy and 
deck permit guidelines” 
Delete Table R.502.2.1 
 

 
(3741)  Appendix G. Appendix G is hereby adopted in its entirety, with the following 

modifications to Section AG105.2: 
  Item 1 Change 48 inches to 60 inches and (1219mm) to (1524mm). 
 

(3842) Appendix J. Appendix J is hereby adopted in its entirety.  
  

(3943) Appendix K. Appendix K is hereby adopted in its entirety.  
 
 

ARTICLE III. THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE (2003) (2009) 
 
Sec. 5-6. Mechanical Code—Adoption of the International Mechanical Code 
(2003) (2009).  
 The International Mechanical Code (2000) (2009), as published by The 
International Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted as the mechanical code in the 
City, except as modified by Section 5-7.  
 
 
 



 26 

Sec. 5-7. Same—Modifications.  
 The International Mechanical Code (2003) (2009), adopted by Section 5-6, is 
hereby modified as follows:  
 (1) Whenever the words "name of jurisdiction" appear in this code, insert the 

words "the City of Gaithersburg”. 
 (2) Whenever the words "building official" appear in this code, they shall be 

deemed to mean the city manager or his her designee.  
 (3) Whenever the words "department" or "department of building safety" appear in 

this code, they shall be deemed to mean the City of Gaithersburg, Department 
of Planning and Code Administration, Permits and Inspections Division.  

 (4) Delete all references to "the ICC Electrical Code" in this (IBC) or any other 
International  Code adopted by this ordinance, and replace with "the City of 
Gaithersburg Code, Chapter 7, Electricity."  

 (5) Chapter 1 - General. Except for direct references to anything mechanically 
related, Chapter 1 of this code is hereby deleted. Administration of the City 
Mechanical Code  shall be performed exactly as described in Section 5-3 of 
the City Building Code, as adopted by this ordinance.  

(6) Section 306.3 After the first sentence add the following:  Access to the attic 
Opening shall be provided by a permanent or pull-down stairway in all new 
Construction.  In existing installations, portable ladders shall be acceptable.  

 (67) Add new Subsection M-502.1.5 "Nail Salons" to read as follows: "Each nail 
treatment station shall be provided with at least 125 cfm of exhaust air. 
Exhaust inlet shall be no more than 10 feet (horizontally) from the station. 
Exhaust air shall be vented to the outside of the building, and proper make-up 
air shall be provided."  

 (78) Subsection 606.2.1.  Return Air Systems.  Delete the entire subsection and 
replace with the following: “Smoke detectors shall be placed in air distribution 
systems as required by the City of Gaithersburg Fire Code, Chapter 11, 
referencing NFiPA 90-A.” 

 

 (89) Subsection 606.2.2. Common supply and return air systems.  Delete the entire 
subsection and replace with the following: “Smoke detectors shall be placed in 
air distribution systems as required by the City of Gaithersburg Fire Code, 
Chapter 11, referencing NFiPA 90-A.” 

 (9) Subsection 607.5.5.1.  Delete the first sentence of Exception 2, and delete 
subsection 2.1 (subsection 2.2 remains as is) and replace with the following: 
  “Exceptions: 
  2. In other than Group H occupancies, equipped throughout with an 
automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2 of the 
International Building Code (as adopted by the City of Gaithersburg), smoke dampers 
are not required at penetrations of exhaust shafts where:  



 27 

    2.1. Bathroom and toilet room, dryer, and domestic kitchen exhaust 
openings  with steel exhaust subducts, having a wall thickness of at least 0.019 inch 
(0.48 mm) extend at least 22 inches vertically and the exhaust fan at the upper 
terminus is powered continuously in accordance with the provisions of Section 
909.11 of the International Building Code, and maintains airflow upward to the 
outside, or” (note: Subsection 2.2 begins at this point) 
 (10) Chapter 10. Delete. (Note: The provisions of this section are covered under a 

combination of the WSSC code and the State of Maryland Boiler and Pressure 
Vessel regulations.)  

 (11) Roof Screening of Rooftop Mechanical Equipment. Screening shall be 
provided as described in amendment # (43) (60) to the City Building Code 
(Chapter 5, Article I, Section 5-3.) 

 
 

ARTICLE IV. THE INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE (2004) 
(2009) 

 
Sec. 5-8. Energy Conservation Code—Adoption of the Energy Conservation 
Code (2004 – Supplement Edition) (2009).  
 The International Energy Conservation Code (2004 – Supplement Edition) (2009), 
as published by The International Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted as the 
energy conservation code for the City, except as modified by Section 5-9.  
 
Sec. 5-9. Same—Modifications.  

The International Energy Conservation Code (2004 – Supplement Edition) (2009), 
adopted by Section 5-8, is hereby modified as follows:  

 (1) Whenever the words "name of jurisdiction" appear in this code, insert the 
words "the City of Gaithersburg ".  

 (2) Whenever the words "building official" appear in this code, they shall be 
deemed to mean the city manager or his her designee.  

 (3) Whenever the words "department" or "department of building safety" appear in 
this code, they shall be deemed to mean the City of Gaithersburg, Department 
of Planning and Code Administration, Permits and Inspections Division.  

 (4) Delete all references to "the ICC Electrical Code" in this (IBC) or any other 
International  Code adopted by this ordinance, and replace with "the City of 
Gaithersburg Code, Chapter 7, Electricity."  

 (5) Chapter 1 – General. Except for direct references to anything related to energy 
conservation, Chapter 1 of this code is hereby deleted. Administration of the 
City Energy  Conversation Code shall be performed exactly as described in 
Section 5-3 of the City Building Code, as adopted by this ordinance.  

 

 
 



 28 

ARTICLE V. THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE (2003) (2009) 
 
Sec. 5-10. Fuel Gas Code—Adoption of the Fuel Gas Code (2003) (2009).  
 The International Fuel Gas Code (2003) (2009), as published by The International 
Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted as the fuel gas code for the City, except as 
modified by Section 5-11. 
 
Sec. 5-11. Same—Modifications.  

The International Fuel Gas Code (2003) (2009), adopted by Section 5-10, is hereby 
modified as follows:  
 (1) Whenever the words "name of jurisdiction" appear in this code, insert the 

words "the City of Gaithersburg".  
 (2) Whenever the words "building official" appear in this code, they shall be 

deemed to mean the city manager or his her designee.  
 (3) Whenever the words "department" or "department of building safety" appear in 

this code, they shall be deemed to mean the City of Gaithersburg, Department 
of Planning and Code Administration, Permits and Inspections Division.  

 (4) Delete all references to "the ICC Electrical Code" in this (IBC) or any other 
International  Code adopted by this ordinance, and replace with "the City of 
Gaithersburg Code, Chapter 7, Electricity."  

 (5) Chapter 1 - General. Except for direct references to anything related to fuel 
gas, Chapter 1 of this code is hereby deleted. Administration of the City Fuel 
Gas Code shall be performed exactly as described in Section 5-3 of the City 
Building Code, as adopted by this ordinance.  

(6) The adoption of the International Fuel Gas Code (2003) (2009) is only for 
sections of the code that are not addressed or covered by the current 
Plumbing and Gasfitting  regulations of the Washington Suburban Sanitary 
Commission (WSSC). 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 29 

ADOPTED by the City Council of Gaithersburg this 16th day of August, 2010. 
 
 
     
       ___________________________________ 
       SIDNEY A. KATZ, MAYOR and 
       President of the Council  
  
DELIVERED to the Mayor of the City of Gaithersburg this 16th day of August, 2010. 
APPROVED by the Mayor of the City of Gaithersburg this 16th  day of August, 2010. 
 
 
 
       ___________________________________ 
              SIDNEY A. KATZ, Mayor 
 
 
 
THIS IS TO CERTIFY that the foregoing Ordinance 
was adopted by the City Council of Gaithersburg, in 
public meeting assembled, on the 16th day of August, 
2010, and that the same was approved by the 
Mayor of the City of Gaithersburg on the 16th day of 
August, 2010. This Ordinance will become effective 
on the 5th day of September, 2010. 
 
 
 
__________________________________________ 
 Angel L. Jones, City Manager 


	BE IT ORDAINED by the Mayor and City Council of Gaithersburg, in public meeting assembled, that Chapter 5 of the City Code entitled “Buildings”, is hereby repealed and re-enacted with amendments to read as follows:
	CHAPTER 5
	BUILDINGS



